
2019-2020 Student Recognition Award Descriptions 

Hosted by ASKCC & the Office of Student Life 

Student Awards 

Student Empowerment Award - This award is given to a student leader that exemplifies peer mentor-ship and 
empowers other students to succeed within the KCC community. This nominee demonstrates excellence in teamwork, 
encouragement, and community-building among students.  

Badger Ambassador Award- This award is presented to an individual who brings positive visibility to KCC and inspires 
other students to show their KCC pride. This visibility may be created through participation in competitions/events, the 
creation of programs, or community service.  

Student Volunteer of the Year - This award is given to the student who has demonstrated leadership in community 
service, dedicating their time and talents to make a difference in the Klamath Falls community. This nominee 
demonstrates initiative, passion for the community, and compassion for those served. 

Student Employee of the Year - This award honors the student employee who has exhibited exceptional support, 
service, and encouragement within their role as a student employee. This nominee has gone above and beyond to 
contribute to the success of their department or the influence of their position through devoting their time and talent to 
serve KCC. 

Bustling Badger Student Award - This award honors the student who has actively contributed to the mission and goals of 
KCC. This student demonstrates overall excellence in scholarship and student engagement. They serve as a source of 
pride and inspiration to other by unselfish service to the KCC community or through overcoming challenges to ensure 
their success.  

Registered Student Club/Organization Awards  

Newcomer RSO Award – This award is given to an outstanding club in its first year of inception, that has, over the course 
of the academic year, demonstrated excellence in programs & events; contributions to the student body, campus and 
community; and recognition and development of leadership potential in members. 

Event of the Year Award – This award is given to a student organization(s) for an outstanding program or event that 
demonstrated originality, creativity, education and relevance for the Klamath Community College student body.  

Outstanding RSO Award – This award is given to an outstanding club that has, over the course of the academic year, 
demonstrated excellence in programs & events; contributions to the student body, campus and community; and 
recognition and development of leadership potential in members. 

Bustling Badger Group Award – This award honors the student club or organization which has actively contributed to the 
mission and goals of KCC. This student demonstrates overall excellence in scholarship and student engagement. They 
serve as a source of pride and inspiration to other by unselfish service to the KCC community.  

RSO Advisor Awards 

Outstanding RSO Advisor Award – honors the faculty/staff RSO advisor member who has exhibited outstanding 
commitment to and support of students in his/her role as a Student Organization advisor or mentor. 

Bustling Badger Staff Award – honors a KCC employee who has exhibited exceptional support, service, and 
encouragement for our KCC students, enhancing their learning and success. 


